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Agenda
•Virtual Reader’s Advisory
•Passive Reader’s Advisory



Virtual 
Reader’s 
Advisory



Form-Based Reader’s Advisory



BookTok



Bookstagram



BookTube



Twitter



Explore!
Pick your favorite social media 
platform from those discussed 
and explore the world of books 
and libraries there.



Passive 
Reader’s 
Advisory



Staff Recommendations



Book Lists



Displays



Practice!
Pick one of the three methods of 
passive reader’s advisory and 
storyboard an example of it. What 
is your theme? What are some 
titles you might include? Where 
would you go to find more?



Review
•There are many ways to 
provide reader’s advisory 
beyond interviews.



Review
•Virtual reader’s advisory can 
take place on the library 
website.



Review
•You can find librarians, other 
book people, and thus 
opportunities and examples for 
RA on just about any social 
media platform.



Review
•The physical library space can 
be used for RA as well in the 
form of displays and staff 
recommendations.
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